REGISTERED No. D-(D)-7%

ST
EXTRAORDINARY

sy D—ave |
PART 11—Section 1

qrbuE ® S
PUB’LISHED BY THQRITY

e

= B
- 7% fazal, AT w18, 1984/dNTE 28, 1906
8, 'QaI-QlVAlSAKHA 28, 1906

do 32]
No. 32] NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, MAY x
e e e

wmﬁ"m-{cﬁmﬁmf o P Tg AW TEER
& w7 & @ W B )

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may
ag = separate compilation

he filed

INISTRY OF LAW, JUSTICE AND COMPANY AFFAIRS
(Legislative Department)

the 18th May, 1984 | Vaisakha 28, 1906 (Saka)

f Parliament received the assent of the President on the

hereby published for general jnformation:—

RITY (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1984

New Delhis

Vhe following Act ©
{8th May, 1984, and is

THE NATIONAL SECU
No. 24 OF 1984
[18th May, 1984.]

amend the National Security Act, 1980, in 1ts application
and the Union territory of Chandigarh.

An Act to
riy-fifth Year of the Republic

to the State of Punjab

BE it enacted by parliament in the Thi

of India as followsi—
e National Security (Amendment)

1. (1) This Act may be called th

Act, 1984.
5th day of April,

(2) It sh ave come into force on the

all be deemed to h
1984. )

urity Act, 1980 (hereinafter referred to s the principal

to the State of Punjab and
t to the amendments spect

2. The National Sec
Act) shall, in its application
Chandigarh, have effect subjec

the Union territory of
fied in sections 3 ) -

Shart

title and
commence-
ment,

Amend-
ment of
Act
65 of 1980
in its appli-
cation 10
Punjab and
Chandi-
garh.




Amend-
ment of
section 3.

Amend-
ment of
section 8,

Insertion
. of new
section
14A.

A

Circum-

. .gtapces in

: which per-
‘ sons may
" be detained
for periods
longer

than three

months

without

obtaining
the

of Advisory

Boards.:

65

2 ) THE GA.ZE'I"I.‘E Oox INDIA EXTRAOR;DINARY [ParT II—

———J——_”-—-:‘
3. In sub-section (4) 'of section 3 of the prmclpal Act, in the proviso,—

'(a) for the words “ten days’ the words ﬁiteen days” shaﬂ be subsu- .
tut.cd : A

~(b) for the words ﬁftccn days”, the words “twenty - days” shall be

substituted. £y i g
: foe -

4, In’ sectlon 8 of the pr1n<:1pal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words “len

. days”, lhe lwords “fifteen dayqﬂ shall be substltuted

2. In the prmc;pal Act after ectmn 14 the follovnng sectlon shau bc
inserted, namely — ; Al ¢ . ' K Rl
: , ] <

€ 41 stL) . , W |
3 ¥ |

;

" ; “14A (1) Notw:thstandmg anythmg ccntamed in the foregomg pro- ‘_
© visions o of this Act, any person in respect of whom - an order’ of detention:

has been made]undcr this Act at any’ time “before the 3rd day: of April;
1985’ mhay be. detained - without obtammg .the: apinion. “of \the Advisory
Board for a period longet: \\thah tﬁree months but not e,xcecdmg' six -
months, from the. date of his- ‘detention- where; such person had been de-
tained with a view to preVenfu“ig him; fro
in any ¢ mannet' pre]udxclal to-—: By

(a) the defcnce oE Indla, or-
(b) the sacunty of Indlaa, or ,

(c) the securlty of the Statc or .

(d) the maintenance of pubhc. order; oL

(e) the mamtcnanc:: of supphes and servmes essen'ual to the commumty

Explanation 1.—The prowsmns of the Explanatwn to’ sub- sectmn o

v (2) of section 3 shall apply: for. the. purposes of this sub—sectmn as they
apply for the purposes “of that sub-sectmn e g i

Exp!anat:on 2+—In thrs sub-sectmn, i dlsturbed area” 'means any
area which is for the time being d&clared by notification under section
3, of the Punjab Disturbed . Areas Act; 1983, or under, section 3 of the:

_Chandngarh Dlsturbcd Amas Act 1983 o be a dlsturbed area. :

2) In the case of any person. to whom sub—s;cctmn (i) applies,
gections 10 to 13 shall have effect sub]ect to- the follomng mod.lﬁca“—
tions; namely:— . 8 ot

’ 0
\ ]

(a) in section 10, “for the words sha]l within th'rca weeks”,-. the .
words “shall, within: four months and two chk.'; shall be substitu-
ted; | ;‘ YR M , __/‘ i

(b)) in sectlon 11——. ' ‘ P ‘ F g

" (i) in . sub- schon (1 ), for the words ~ “sevén Weeks the
, words “five months and thrce chks shall be subsututed

[T S e iy

C mg, in any chstnrbed area, :

32.0£ 1983, |

33 of 1983



Vi T A
RRTEEE S

R ———"
7 A .‘ .'."_. L2 e Y " _‘,.- _-1';_- "..-‘;:.,,, o

5 of 1984.

65 of

3 .

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY : ;
for the words ‘“detention of the

continued detention ., of the per-

(i) in sub-section (2),
person concerned”, the words
con concerned” shall be substituted; :
" (¢) in section 12, for the words “for the dgteﬁtion", at both the
places where they occur, the words “for the continued detention”

shall be substituted; . .
ds “twelve months”, the words

Repeal |

- (d) in section 1|3»,- fot the words
“two years” shall be substituted.’. . _
6. (1) The National Security. (Amendment) Ordinance, 1984, is here-
by repealed. o Y _ L and
) . : . 2 ng el i saving.
(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
under the principal Act, as amended by the said Ordinance, shall be -
deemed to have been done or taken under ,t_he‘pﬁncipa'l Act, ag amended
by this Act. ' ) 1 . ' o o g = B '
1 o A
- ' R. V. S. PERE SASTRI, <
' : " Secy. to the Govt, of India.
) % E 3 .
J hll ; [
o3 3
X ' i
\‘\ ) -
F = LR - 'I’
¢ \

STy
1984

‘PRINTED BY THE GENERAL MANAGER, GOVERNMENT OF INDIA PRESS, MINTO
NEW DELHI AND PUBLISHED BY THE CONTROLLER, OF PUBLICATIONS,; DE.LI-‘II'




65 of 1930.

~

e

'REGISTERED No. D-(D)-72
N =

_ EXTRAORDINARY
sy U—ao2 1
PART 1I—Section 1

qifyEe § @ ad
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
*_::_—__———f_,__——————,__——’——""—‘—‘______,f‘“—”_——:;
o 74] % faeet, ARAG fqavxe 1, 1984[®d 10 1906
No. 74] NEW DELHIL, SATURDAY, EPTEMBER 1, 1984/BHADRA 10, 1906

S/

—

e
wmﬁ*hﬁqﬁamftmﬁrmha{mﬁm

B Eq W TN w5\
Separale paging is given to this Vart in order {hat it may be filed

as a separate compilation

_f._f,.’-.___f—___t_r——*

—

MINISTRY OF 'LAW, JUSTICE AND COMPANY AFFAIRS

(Legislative Department) :
New Delhi, the 1st September 1954/ Bhadra 10, 1006 (Sae)

The following Act of parliament received the assent of the President
on the 31st August, 1984, and 1s hereby published for general informa-

tion:— : o
THE NATIONAL SECURITY (SECOND AMENDMENT)
' ACT, 1954 ~
No. 60 OF 1984 ,
' [31st Augusts 198&.]

Ao Act}_iurﬂler to amend the National Security Act, 1980

.- pg it enacted by parliament in the Thirty-fifth Year of the Republic

" of India as follows:—

1. (1) This Act may be called the National Security (Second Amend-

ment) Act, 1984
2) It shall ve deemed to have come into force on the 21st day of

June, 1984.
2. In the National Security Act, 1980 (hereinafter referred to as the

principal Act), after
namely:—
w5 Where & person has been detained in pursuance of an
order of detention [whether made before or after the commence-
ment of the National Security (Second Amendment) Act, 19841
£

4

section 5. the following section shall be inserted,

Short title
and com-
mence-
ment,

Inse'rt'xon
of new
section S5A.

Grounds
of deten-
tion
gayerable.



[ : ' (@) such jorder shal]l not be

deemed to be invalid or inopera-.
. -Aive merely because one or so

me of the grounds ig or are—
l r
(i) vague, ' '

(ii) non-exjstent, ) 1
(iii) not relevant, :

(iv) not connected

or not proximately connected with..
such person, or

(v) invalid for any other reason whatsoever,

and it is not, therefore, possible to hold that the Government
or officer making such order would have been satisfied as provid-
ed in section 3

with reference to the remaining ground or
grounds and made the order of detention;

Amend-
ment of
- section 14,

3. In section 14 0

{ the principal Act, for sub-
. sub-section shall be

section (2), the following
substituted, namely: —

“(2) The expirv- i

on order (hereafter
in this sub-section referred to as the ear ier detention order) shall

ch earlier detention order has been made before or

after the commencement of the National Security  (Second
Amendment) Act, 1984] bar the making of anoth

(hereafter in this sy -section referred to as the
tion order) under section 3 against the same person:

Provided that in a tase where no fresh facts ha\{c_ml:
the expiry or revocation of the earlier detentiop order made against
such person, the maximum period for which such berson may be

detained in pursuance of the subsequent detention order shall, in
* -To case, extend beyond the expi

the date of detention under th

en after

Amex;qd. . 4. In the principal Act as applicable to the State of Punjab and the
ment of | Union territory of Chandigarh, in section 144, in sub-section (2),—
section .

144, I

(1) in the opening
10 to 13", the words an
tuted:

portion, for the words and figureg “

sections
d figures “sections 10 to 14~

shall be Substi-.

(i1) after clause (d),

the followfng clause shall
namely: —

be inserted,
' o
“(e) in section 14, in the proviso to sub-section (2), for the.
words “twelve months”, the words “two years” ghall be substi-. .
tnted.’,




& of 1984, .

Skc, 1] * THE GAZEITE OF INDIA EXTRAGRDINARY 3

—_—

5. (I) The National Security (Second -Amendment) Ordinance, 1984,  Repesl

is hereby repealed. . and Saving,
(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything dopne or any action taken

under the principal Act, as amended by the said Ordinance, shall be

deemed to have been done or taken under the principal Act, as amended

by this Act.

L | R. V. S. PERI SASTRI, |

Secy. to the Gouf, of India.

PRINTED BY THE GENERAL MANAGER, GOVERNMENT CF INDIA PRESS, MINTO ROAD,
NEW_ DELHI AND PUBLISHED BY THE CONTROLLER OF PUBLICATIONS, DELHI, 1984



- _REGISTERED o, D-(D)-72

EXTRAORDINARY
wr H—gog ¢
P: ’LR’I‘ II—Seetion 1

R ° SR
I”UBLISHED BY AUTHGRITY

He 26] - 7§ ﬁ«w, uEIE, 2§ .k: : m«ssfﬁf B n‘;'o o
- Ne.26] | NEW DELHI, ra’m.u, MARZH 29, 19% CHAITRA 8, 1907

- »—m*?r?nm rrr'w e fe ug e waww
- & YR T AT 5S4 - |
p— Separite mmtrzg,a ahven tosthis Part bn orller (hat it may be filed
o % A wmmm ol Mion

"Lsmﬂf m" LAW .nwz:a mg'rmt
o islative Department)
New Delhi, the Stk March, 1085/Cheitre 8, 1907 (Salc)
The following Act of Parliament received the assent ‘tﬁ_‘:_f the Presi-
dent on the 29th Mareh, . 1985, and is hereby }fm:bi-ishueﬁz for .gﬁﬂerza'l
information:.

| THE \fu‘IoNAL SECURITY (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1983
. No. 22 or 1035

[29¢h March, 19851
ational Security Act, 1980, in its

A’sl Act fn,rthm tﬂ amend thk.. ?sa
' ) Punjab and the met tcrr;,taw of

}32 it enacted by Pa’rlmmen* in the THiM(y-sheh ée,‘r of the Rap-_-= blie
al India as follows:—

1. This Act may Dbe called the National Secusity (Ameﬂdment) Aet,
. 1985,

licable to the State of Amend:

2 sub-seetwn (1) of ment of !
‘ day of April ";3"‘:“’“ -
il, 1936" shall be
R. V. S. PERI SASTRI, .
Secy. to the Gout. of India. '

PRISTED DY THZ CENERAL MANACER, COVERNITTH

| P : PrDSs, MINTO Roan,
NEW DELUT AND PUBLISOED BY TIR CONTROLLER OF PUroiticsrioss, Dewrr, 1085

b SRR ST
e s T B R

5 agEs




o & . =t-(3eA)-127 REGISTERED No. D_(DN).127

HRd .
The Gazette of IJndia-

EXTRAORDINARY
. wry Il—eve 4
/ PART II—Section 1
siu=R @ st
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

1 A4
"2

Ho 36 7% faeelt, @M1, W€ 31, 1987/WIH 9, 1909
No. 36] NEW DELHI, MONDAY, AUGUST 31, x987/BHADRA 9, 1909

@ WTr ® P e wen 9 s g fewe P ag s W
® 7 W T AT TR N -
Separafe paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed
as a separate compilation

(Legislative Department)
New Delhi, the 31st August, 1987/Bhadra $, 1809 (Saka)

The following Act of Parliament received the assent of the President
on the 31st August, 1987, and is hereby published for general informa-
tion: — !

THE NATIONAL SECURITY (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1987
No, 27 or 1987
[31st August, 1987.1 -
An Act further to amend the National Security Act, 1980, in its appli-
cation to the State of Punjab and the Union territory of Chandi-
garh,

Br it enacted by Parliament in the Thirty-eighth Year of the Republic

of India as follows:— ’

1. (1) This Act may be called the National Security (Amendment)  gport
Act, 1887 title and

commence-

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 9th day of jent
June, 1987. |

3. The National Security Act, 1980 (hereinafter referred to as the  Amend-
principal Act) shall, in its application to the State of Punjab and the  ment of

Union territory of Chandigarh, have effect subject to the amendments é:c;

specified in section 3. : 1980 in
its
applica-
tion to
Punjab
and
) Chandi-
() earh,




¢

2 : THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAOR INARY {Part II—
’—’T_'—_‘:._'—’_____——-—————_'J— — T ‘F_____,a_———‘_'—___“_—____—r———__—“" ==
EENEE 3. In the principal Act, after section 14, the following section shall be
tion. of inserted, namely:— ~

new '

section

14A.

Circum- “4A. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing
:ﬁgﬁs " provisions of this Act, or in any judgment,' decree or order of any
persons court or other authority, any person in respect of whom an order of
may be detention has been made under this Act at any time pefore the 8th
detained day of June, 1988 may be detained without obtaining the opinion of
t"ri i the Advisory Board for a period longer than three months, but not
f;’;;’m. exceeding six months, from the date of his detention where such
than person had been detained with a view to preventing him, in any
three disturbed area,— '

months )

without (1) from interfering with the- efforts of Government in cop-
obtaining ing with the terrorist and disruptive activities; and

the

opinio{t (ii) from acting in any manner prejudicial to—

; .
idvimw (a) the defence of India; or

Boards. )

(b) the security of India; or
(¢) the security of the State; or
(d) the maintenance of public order; Or

(e) the maintenance of supplies and services essential to
the community.

' miplanation 1—The provisions of the Explanation to sub-section
(2) of section 3 shall apply for the purposes of this sub-section as
they apply for the purposes of that sub-section.

Explandtion 2. In this sub-section, «gdisturbed area” means any
area which is for the time being declared by notification under section
3 of the Punjab Disturbed Areas Act, 1983, or under section '3 of the 32 of 1983.
Chandigarh Disturbed Areas Act, 1983, to be 2 disturbed area. 3308 1983,

Explanation. 3—In this sub-section, aperrorist and disruptive
activities” means “terrorist acts” and “disruptive activities” within
the meaning of the Terrorist and Disruptive Activities (Prevention)
Ordinance, 1987. Ord. 2 of
1987.
(2) In the case of any person 1o whom sub-section (1) applies,
sections 3, 8 and 10 fo 14 shall have offect subject to the following
modifications, pamely:—

(a) in section 3,—
(i) in sub-section (4), in the proviso,—

(A) for the words “ten days”, the words “fifteen
days” shall be substituted;

. (B) for the words “fifteen days”, the words “twenty
days” shall be substituted; :

(i) in sub-section (5), for the words “seven days’, the
words “fifteen days” shall be substituted;




24 of 1984,

60 ef 1984

23 of 1985,

Ord_ 3 of
1987

-..___‘_—i-____‘—‘—_____‘e_.e___ ——e ey =

e AR VR,
() in sectioy 8, in sub-section (1), for the words “tep days”,
the wordg “fifteen days” ghaly be substituted;

(¢) in section 10, for the words “shall, within three weeks”,
he wordsg “shal], within foyp months ang two weeks” shall pe
substitutedr; ' |

(@) in section 11,

(i) in Sub-section (1), for the words “geyen weeks” the

words “fiye monthg and threa Weeks” shajy be substituted;

(i) in sub-section (2), for the Words “detentjon of {he
berson concerned” the words “continyeq detentiop of the
berson concerned” shay be: substituted;

(e) in section 12, for the wordg « or the detention”, at both
the placeg where they oceur, the words “for the continued deten.
tion” shall be substituted;

(f) in section 13, for the words “twelve months”, the wWords
“two years” ghajj be substituted;

(9) in section 14, in the Provisp tg sub-section (2), tor the
words “twelye months”, the words “fyq years” shajj be sub-

%L‘_i_*\‘__

PRINYED gy THE MANAGER, GOVERNMENT OF INpIy PRESS, MINTO ROAD, Npw DELHI
AND PUBLISHED BY THE CONTROLLER OF PUBLICATIGNS, DELHI, 1987

Repouls,

Repeajs
and
saving,




63 of 1830.

EXTRAORDINARY
wyr 1—aeE i
PART —Section 1

vt € FEANET
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

—_— e — e ——T — o= — T ——— =

o 55] af faeslt, TG fmeac 3, 1988/FF 11 1910

No. 55! |NEW DELHI FRIDAY, SEPTEMBER 2, 1gBB[BHADRA 11,2910

_—;:FF:::E__;——:’—_——#‘:;::;—_JaT;__A_::.‘::LH—iFL :—_:T_,“.-T.‘.'_.Tf T
g W & e T wwar &1 g op TE SN HE

a‘:mﬂ"mmtﬁ%;

Gepurate pagiug is given o this Pavt jn order that it may pe filed
) as @ separafe compilation
i - plasic SR

e i e

e T e
MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
' (Legisiative Department)

R e

New Delhi, the omd September, 1988/ Bhadra 11, 1910 (Salka)

The following Act of Parliament veceived the assent of  the President
on the 1st geptember, 1988, and is hereby puhlished for general infor-
mmation:—

THE NATIONAL SECURITY (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1988

No. 43 ov 1988
[1st September, 19869 )

An Act further t© amend the National security Act, 1980, in its appli-

cation to the Staté of Punjab and the Union territory of Chandt-

garh.

Bg it enacted by parliament in the Thirty-ninth year of the
Republic of India as follows:—

1. (1) This Act may be called the National Security (Amendrﬁent}
Act, 1988. .

@ It ghall be deemed to have come into force on the 26th
day of May, 1988.

9. In the National Securily Act, 1980 (hereinaiter referred to as the
principal Act), as applicable to the State of Punjab and {he Union terri-
tory of Chandigarh, in sub-section (1) of section 144, for the figures,
letters and words “8th day of June, 1988", the figures, jetters and words
sgth day of June,’ 1939" shall be substituted.

prinG WEd SRS T & e

el IR ¢ & R Cew ga

Short title
ang om-
mence-
ment.

Amend.
ment of
seetion

14A.




tpea;
ad
Aving.

S RAMAIAH,
Secy. to the Govt. of Indig




